
PRESENTING  THE
CLASS OF 2012

CHS VALEDICTORIANCHS VALEDICTORIAN
KAYLA ELAMKAYLA ELAM

HHS VALEDICTORIANHHS VALEDICTORIAN
SIERRA SHELPSIERRA SHELP



Page 2 The Clarendon Enterprise • Graduation Edition May 24, 2012

EnterpriseTHE CLARENDON

A SPECIAL GRADUATION SUPPLEMENT TO

�
Roger A. Estlack, Publisher & Editor
Ashlee Estlack, Contributing Editor

Tara Hogan, Offi ce Director
Morgan Wheatly, Advertising & Page Design

�
Copyright © 2012. All Rights Reserved.

Brooklyn Allison Bailey

Congratulations from

Roberston Funeral Directors

Elizabeth Dawn 
Christopher

Congratulations from

Bar H Barbecue & More

Trevela Michelle Dronzek 

Congratulations from

Dronzek, Inc. 

Nathan Bryan Dziedzic 

Congratulations from

VFW Memorial Post #7782

Brooklyn Allison 
Bailey

Brooklyn Bailey, daughter of 
Mike and Misty LaRoe, played 
basketball and threw shot-put 
and discus for two years, band 
for four years, went to state in 
Solo and Ensemble her freshman 
year, joined Junior Historians her 
senior year, and was in Gifted 
and Talented all four years. She 
also worked at Dairy Queen and 
the Clarendon Community Care 
Center throughout her junior and 
senior year. She plans on going 
to Clarendon College in the fall 
after graduation.

Elizebeth Dawn 
Christopher

Elizebeth Christopher, daugh-
ter of Clay and Tammy Chris-
topher, was a Student Athletic 
Trainer for four years, a mem-
ber of the Radio Team for the 
Clarendon FFA for four years, 
participated in 4H Food and 
Nutrition Quiz Bowl her sopho-
more and junior year advancing 
to state roundup her sophomore 
year. She was in Junior Histori-
ans and FCCLA her senior year 
and was nominated treasurer of 
FCCLA. 

Elizebeth plans to attend the 
Phlebotomy program at Amarillo 
College in the fall.

Trevela Michelle 
Dronzek

Trevela Michelle Dronzek, 
daughter of Dan and Teresa 
Dronzek, played basketball and 
softball on varsity for four years, 
making the playoffs in softball 
all four years. Her basketball 
team made the playoffs for two 
years. She was basketball captain 
her junior and senior years. She 
ran track for two years and cross 
country for four years, advanc-
ing with the team to Regionals 
her junior and senior year and 
also advancing to State with the 
team during her senior year. She 
also advanced to Area in track 
her senior year. She was a mem-
ber of Junior Historians and Stu-
dent Council her senior year and 
a cheerleader for three years. She 
was awarded the Fighting Heart 
Award, was a Homecoming 
Court candidate, and participated 
in band for three years. Trevela 
plans to attend West Texas A&M 
or Texas Tech.

Nathan Bryan Dziedzic
Nathan Dziedzic, son of Gary 

and Sonya Dziedzic, played foot-
ball for two years, advancing to 
playoffs both years, and threw 
shot and discus for three years.

He was also involved in UIL, 
advancing to state in number 
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Kayla Brooke Elam 

Congratulations from

Greenbelt Water Authority

Kirsten Shelby Fine 

Congratulations from

Morrow Drilling & Service

Marqueda Hydeia Gaines

Congratulations from

J&W Lumber

Jay B. Hall

Congratulations from

Joe’s Lawn & Tree Care

sense.
He was a member of the Ju-

nior Historians, and competed 
the state level in NHD his senior 
year.

Nathan plans to attend South 
Plains College to major in me-
chanical engineering.

Kayla Brooke Elam
Kayla Brooke Elam, daughter 

of Clifford and Mary Ann John-
son, was a UIL competitor in sci-
ence and editorials, advancing 
to Regionals the last three years 
in science and her senior year in 
editorials. She advanced with the 
Science team to state her junior 
year. She has received Honor C’s 
in many classes. She was also in-
ducted into the National Honor 
Society her junior year. She won 
the Voice of Democracy essay 
contest her senior year, winning 
her two scholarships. She has 
volunteered in projects at the 
Donley County Senior Citizens 
Center. Kayla plans to attend 
Southwestern Oklahoma State 
University where she will begin 
her studies to become a pharma-
cist. She is valedictorian of her 
class.

Kirsten Shelby
Fine

Kirsten Shelby Fine, daughter 
of Randy and Vicky Tolbert, has 
attended Clarendon High School 
throughout her high school ca-
reer. She participated in march-
ing band during the fi rst semester 
of her freshman year. During her 
sophomore year she participated 
in FFA and earned top seller and 
then went on to achieve an aca-
demic award during her senior 
year. She plans to continue her 
education at Amarillo College 

to earn an associate’s degree in 
criminal justice and then transfer 
to Oklahoma University to major 
in architecture.

Marqueda Hydeia 
Gaines

Marqueda Gaines, daughter 
of Randy Gaines and Tiffany 
Calloway, has attended CHS for 
four years. She participated in 
basketball for four years. She ran 
track all four years and advanced 
to state her junior year. She ran 
cross country her sophomore and 
junior years. She played soft-
ball her junior and senior years. 
Marqueda became a cheerleader 
her senior year. She participated 
in UIL Calculator and UIL Prose 
while advancing to regionals her 
senior year. She participated in 
the community highway clean-
up. She was a member of Stu-
dent Council her junior year; in 
addition, she became an offi cer 
her senior year. Marqueda will 
attend West Texas A & M Uni-
versity to major in nursing.

Jay B. Hall
Jay Hall, son of Joe and 

Stephanie Hall, spent time out 
of school learning new programs 
and actively participating in 
church events. He began work-
ing at Allsups in the summer of 
2011, and is still employed there. 
He will attend Clarendon Col-
lege to obtain basic education. 

Devonte Dashun 
Hardaway

Devonte Hardaway, son of 
Deanna Weatherton and Michael 
Hardaway, played football for 4 
years and played basketball for 
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What’s Ahead What’s Ahead 
Is Up To You.Is Up To You.

Congratulations on your 
graduation! The decisions 
you make now will lay the 

groundwork for your future. 
Make your next step after 

graduation the fall semester 
at Clarendon College. Our 
helpful advisors can help 

you put together a selection 
of courses that complement 

your strengths and interests, 
so you can start navigating 

your future.

Call today for information or a campus tour!

806.874.3571

Associate degrees • Certifi cate programs • Continuing education • Online education

Unleash your potential!

Congratulations on your Congratulations on your 
graduation! The decisions graduation! The decisions 
you make now will lay the you make now will lay the 

groundwork for your future. groundwork for your future. 
Make your next step after Make your next step after 

graduation the fall semester graduation the fall semester 
at Clarendon College. Our at Clarendon College. Our 
helpful advisors can help helpful advisors can help 

you put together a selection you put together a selection 
of courses that complement of courses that complement 

your strengths and interests, your strengths and interests, 
so you can start navigating so you can start navigating 

your future.your future.
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Devonte Dashun 
Hardaway 

Congratulations from

Osburn Appliance & Service

Charleston Lee Harris 

Congratulations from

Kenny’s Barber Shop

Roger Foard Henderson 

Congratulations from

3H All Natural Beef

Kae Lea Hewett

Congratulations from

Lee’s Insurance

2 years. He participated in band 
his senior year and advanced to 
area. He ran track for 4 years and 
made it to area his senior year.

Charleston Lee Harris
Charleston Harris, son of 

Charles and Carmer Harris, 
played football for four years, 
ran track for four years, advanc-
ing to Bi-District freshman and 
senior year, area his sophomore 
and junior years and advanced in 
the sprint and 800m relay to area 
and regionals his junior year and 
in sprint relay to area senior year.

His sophomore year he got 
honorable mention for defense, 
junior year 2nd team LB, se-
nior year fi rst team RB, and his 
junior year he and three other 
teammates broke the 800m relay 
school record. Charleston plans 
to attend Clarendon College 
and work as a dispatcher at the 
Donley County Sheriff Offi ce. 
After college graduation he plans 
to attend Amarillo Police Acad-
emy.

Roger Foard 
Henderson

Roger Foard Henderson, son 
of Dina Henderson, was a UIL 
One-Act competitor for one year 
and received all-star cast three 
times. Roger will attend West 
Texas A&M in the fall.

Kae Lea Hewett 
Kae Hewett is the daughter of 

Jeff and Cindy Hewett. She was 
involved in student council for 
four years, serving as secretary 
her junior year and vice presi-
dent her senior year. She was 
also involved in junior historians 
for four years, serving as reporter 

her senior year. Kae was a cheer-
leader for four years, serving as 
captain for two years. She was in 
band for four years. She was in 
4H for three years. Kae was in-
ducted into National Honor So-
ciety her junior year. Kae was in 
UIL for 2 years. She also com-
peted in Texas National History 
Day for two years, receiving the 
women in Texas History award 
her junior year along with out-
standing in her region and 4th 
place her senior year. Kae will at-
tend Southern Nazarene Univer-
sity to major in business fi nance.

Cody Zant Hill
Cody Hill, son of Scott and 

Kim Hill, participated in Claren-
don’s One Act play for 3 years, 
advancing to zone his sopho-
more year in the play A Bridal 
Night, district his junior year in 
the play Home At 6, and area his 
senior year in the play Conform. 
He was also involved with Boy 
Scouts. He achieved Life Scout 
in Boy Scouts, attained all of his 
requirements for Eagle Scout 
and also accomplished getting 
his Texas Award Medal in Boy 
Scouts. Cody plans on continu-
ing his education with a major in 
Gunsmithing at Ashworth Col-
lege.

Cody James Holman
Cody Holman, son of Billy 

Holman and Chandra Larance, 
was in One Act Play for two 
years, advancing to zone his 
freshman and junior years. He 
was in the Academically Ac-
celerated Students program for 
eleven years. He was a com-
petitor in Science UIL his junior 
year, and was awarded honors in 
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Jerami 
Johnson 

Amber 
Keelin 

Cody 
King

Mason 
Lowrie

Jerah 
Luna

Jordan 
Luna

Brandon 
McAfee

Cynthia 
Medina

Caleb 
Mitchell

Gage 
Nelson

Jacob 
Pigg

Tylee 
Williams

Jayson 
Pigg

Krista 
Reynolds

Chandace
Ritchie

Mikayla 
Shadle

Ashley
Smith

Christopher
Shults

Tyler 
Smith

Jaimie 
Vinson

Kristen 
Watson

McKaelie 
Thomas

Wesley
Williams

Samuel 
Wolfe

Joseph
Allen

Conner
Bevers

Christopher
Blackburn

Kassidy
Burton

William 
Lewis

Joshua 
Llewellyn

Cassie
Pickle

Jacob
Ramirez

Kadee
Riggs

Sierra
Shelp

Patricia
Valles

Rance
Watt

Ethan 
Naylor

Dehvan 
Neeley

Laura
Ketzer

Brooklyn 
Bailey

Elizebeth 
Christopher

Trevela 
Dronzek

Nathan 
Dziedzic

Anna
Johnson

Cody 
Hill

Cody 
Holman

Kae 
Hewett

Kayla 
Elam

Kirsten 
Fine

Marqueda 
Gaines

Jay
Hall

Devonte 
Hardaway

Roger 
Henderson

Charleston 
Harris

We are proud of our awesome seniors and we wish them success, 
happiness and a very bright future.

Clarendon • Wellington
Member FDIC • Equal Housing Lender

www.pilgrimbank.com
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Cody Zant Hill

Congratulations from

Sandell Drive-In

Cody James Holman

Congratulations from

Bar H Barbecue & More

Anna Christine Johnson 

Congratulations from

Sonic Drive-In

Jerami Adam Johnson 

Congratulations from

White’s Feed & Seed

his history, English, and Spanish 
classes. He plans on attending 
West Texas A & M University to 
major in foreign languages and 
cultures.

Anna Christine 
Johnson

Anna Christine Johnson 
is the daughter of Mike and 
Cliftie Johnson. She has at-
tended Clarendon Elementary, 
Clarendon Jr. High, Clarendon 
High School, and also Coman-
che High School. She has taken 
honors physics, been in U.I.L 
Computer Applications, and also 
went to All-Region and All-State 
Band. She has worked at Dairy 
Queen, Pizza Hut, Allsup’s, and 
currently she works at the Sonic 
Drive-In. After graduation she 
plans on going to Clarendon Col-
lege in the fall for 2 years, then 
she plans to go to WT or Ama-
rillo College.

Jerami Adam Johnson
Jerami Johnson, son of Scotty 

and Tina Ferris, played football 
four years advancing to play-
offs every year, ran track all four 
years going beyond district since 
his sophomore year, played base-
ball starting his junior year going 
to playoffs his senior year, and 
power lifted his junior year plac-
ing second at the district meet. 

He has also been a member of 
the National Honor Society since 
his induction his junior year and 
has participated in UIL, NHD, 
Junior Historians, Student Coun-
cil his junior year, and class rep-
resentative his junior and senior 
year. 

Jerami plans to go to 
Clarendon College and receive 

his associates while he thinks 
about his career in either Me-
chanical Engineering or Game & 
Art Design.

Amber Leeann Keelin
Amber Keelin, daughter of 

Teresa Pickens and David Keelin, 
played basketball for three years, 
ran track for four years, advanc-
ing to regionals every year and to 
state her junior year. She played 
varsity softball for two years, 
cheered for two years, and ran 
cross country for three years. She 
participated in horse judging for 
one year and advanced to state 
as a freshman. She was also in-
volved in student council for two 
years and was a class offi cer for 
three years. She was a member 
of FCCLA and advanced to state 
in entrepreneurship as a senior. 
She will be attending Clarendon 
College in the fall.

Cody Wayne King
Cody King, son of Laura and 

Sean King, fi rst attended Sam-
norwood High School where he 
participated in football, basket-
ball, and drama. He then trans-
ferred to Clarendon High School 
during his junior year and was 
involved in track throwing the 
shot and disc. He has plans for 
getting his bachelor’s in business 
and graphic design.

Mason Dean Lowrie 
Mason Lowrie, son of Chris-

tina Alexander and Nathan Low-
rie, occupied himself with the 
sport of skateboarding and also 
making music. Mason plans to 
attend South Plains College.
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Amber Leeann Keelin

Congratulations from

Cattlemens 2 Feedlot

Cody Wayne King

Congratulations from

Lowe’s Family Center

Mason Dean Lowrie

Congratulations from

Signs Plus

Jerah Mariah Luna

Congratulations from

Security Abstract Company

Jerah Mariah Luna
Jerah Luna, daughter of Jo-

seph and Terri Luna, was an 
active member in FCCLA, Ju-
nior Historians, and band. She 
competed in powerlifting for 2 
years, and won three gold med-
als. She made the All-Region 
band 3 years, advanced to area 2 
years. She competed on the UIL 
Current Issues and Events team 
for 3 years. She was the 2011-12 
president of Junior Historians, 
and Family Career & Communi-
ty Leaders of America. She was 
an active youth member at the 
First Baptist Church for 6 years 
and has help participate with nu-
merous fund-raisers and mission 
trips.

Jordan Malachi Luna
Jordan Luna, son of Ter-

ri Luna, played basketball for 
3 years, football 4 years, and 
helped with the baseball team for 
4 years. He has qualifi ed for re-
gional UIL competition in Social 
Studies and Number Sense as a 
team member and individual. 
He advanced with the Number 
Sense team to state competition. 
Jordan has also given back to 
his community through highway 
cleanup, canned food and coat 
drives at CHS, and Teens in the 
Driver Seat safety checks. He’s 
a member of the local chapter of 
Junior Historians and National 
Honor Society, serving as presi-
dent. He has served on the CHS 
Student Council for 4 years and 
is the Council president. Jordan 
will attend Texas A&M Univer-
sity in College Station this fall to 
study mathematics. He is saluta-
torian of his class.

Brandon Nile McAfee 
Brandon McAfee, son of 

Steve and Pauline McAfee, 
played football for two years. 
He was involved in Boy Scouts 
and received his Eagle in 2011. 
He was in Junior Historians for 
one year. Brandon plans to go 
Clarendon College for the next 
two years and then move away 
to major in mechanical engineer-
ing. 

Cynthia Renee Medina 
Cynthia Medina, granddaugh-

ter of Haskell and Edith Sorrells, 
played in the Bronco Band for 
four years, participated in UIL 
Calculator and Mathematics her 
junior year. She was the manager 
of Cross Country, Basketball, 
and Softball her senior year, par-
ticipated in 4H Food and Nutri-
tion Bowl competition her fresh-
man and junior year, was a mem-
ber of FCCLA her senior year. 
She was also part of the Theatre 
Shorts plays for two years. She 
helped with several mission trips 
and church activities, and she 
worked at Allsups her senior 
year. She plans to attend Frank 
Phillips Community College and 
major in Psychology to become 
a Clinical Psychologists after her 
degree is achieved.

Caleb Dee Mitchell
Caleb Mitchell, son of the 

late Jimmie Mitchell and Jean-
nie Graham and Tracy Morris, 
played both football and golf for 
one year. 

He also played baseball for 
four years and was a part of the 
school one act play for his senior 
year. 

Caleb plans to attend 
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Jordan Malachi Luna 

Congratulations from

Shelton Law Offi ce

Brandon Nile McAfee

Congratulations from

Stavenhagen Video

Cynthia Renee Medina

Congratulations from

Dronzek, Inc.

Caleb Dee Mitchell

Congratulations from

McKinney’s Motor Co.

Clarendon College to major in 
physical education.

Gage Lee Nelson 
Gage Nelson, son of Amanda 

Nelson, played tennis for one 
year, played football for two 
years, played baseball, and ran 
track for three years. He was 
involved in UIL social studies, 
winning district as a team and ad-
vancing to Regionals his junior 
year. He was inducted into Na-
tional Honor Society his junior 
year, holding the offi ce of Vice 
President. Gage plans to attend 
Clarendon College in the fall.

Jacob Jack Pigg
Jacob Jack Pigg, eldest son 

of Glyn and Jenifer Pigg, was a 
member of 4-H, FFA, and played 
varsity football for 4 years, earn-
ing All-District honors for 3 
years, and made the Globe-News 
Super Team his senior year. He 
was a member of the AB Honor 
Roll for four years and was in-
ducted into the National Honor 
Society. He competed on a FFA 
Livestock Judging Team that has 
qualifi ed for state the last 3 con-
secutive years, has placed in the 
top ten at numerous invitational 
and area contests. During his se-
nior year his team won the Area 
championship and placed 2nd at 
the state meet, where he was 4th 
high-point individual. By plac-
ing 2nd, his team has qualifi ed 
for and will compete in the Na-
tional Western contest in Denver, 
CO.

Jayson Glyn Pigg
Jayson Pigg, son of Glyn and 

Jenifer Pigg, was a football play-
er for four years, and was very 

involved in Donley County 4-H 
and Clarendon FFA. Through 
FFA Jayson participated on the 
Skills team for two years and the 
Livestock Judging team for four 
years, where his team qualifi ed 
for state three consecutive years 
from 2010-2012. In 2012 his 
team won 1st at the Area 1 con-
test and placed 2nd at State Con-
test. Through 4-H Jayson showed 
steers, competed in Horse Quiz 
Bowl, Livestock Judging and held 
many positions. His Livestock 
Judging team qualifi ed for state 
three times from 2010-2012. Jay-
son served as the Donley County 
Club President from 2009-2012. 
He served as a District 1 Coun-
cil Offi cer from 2010-2012, was 
a member of Texas 4-H Coun-
cil during 2011, and served as 
a Livestock Ambassador from 
2011-2012. Jayson plans to at-
tend Texas Tech University and 
major in Agricultural & Applied 
Economics.

Krista Marissa 
Reynolds

Krista Reynolds, daughter of 
Steve and Missy Reynolds, was 
a student trainer for 3 years and 
was on the golf team for 3 years. 
She was also involved in cross 
country and basketball. She was 
in 4-H 4 years and was an offi cer 
for 3 years. She went to the 4-H 
state meet in horse judging her 
freshman year and nutrition quiz 
bowl her sophomore year. She 
was also Vice President of the 
FCCLA chapter her senior year 
and advanced to state with Am-
ber Keelin in their Entrepreneur-
ship project. Krista volunteered 
in projects such as the highway 
cleanup for 4-H, meals on wheels 
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Gage Lee Nelson

Congratulations from

WootWick’s Pit Stop

Jacob Jack Pigg

Congratulations from

Every Nook & Cranny

Jayson Glyn Pigg

Congratulations from

JD Steakout

Krista Marissa Reynolds

Congratulations from

Greenbelt Electric Cooperative

for the Donley County Senior 
Citizens Center, and cooking 
breakfast for the families staying 
in the Ronald McDonald house 
in Amarillo. She would like to at-
tend Amarillo College in the fall.

Chandace Hanna 
Leigh Ritchie

Chandace Ritchie, daughter 
of Charlotte Durham and Ken-
neth Ritchie, step-daughter of 
Christopher Durham, was a mem-
ber of Junior Historians for four 
years, elected Treasurer for one 
term. She was a member of the 
Annual Staff for three years and 
she was editor her junior year. 
She was a member of FCCLA 
and 4-H for one year and volun-
teered at Special Friends Camp 
one summer. She worked various 
jobs throughout high school. She 
was awarded the Cindy Billing-
ton Award for a research paper. 
She will attend Clarendon Col-
lege in the fall.

Mikayla LaVelle 
Shadle 

Mikayla Shadle, daughter of 
Michael Shadle and Michelle 
Hall, played the saxophone in 
band four years and was drum 

major for one year. She has also 
been a class offi cer every year. 
She was involved in One Act 
Play and theatre. She was a UIL 
competitor in Current Issues and 
Events and Spelling, advanc-
ing to Regionals the last three 
years and was a state competi-
tor in NHD. She held the offi ce 
of secretary of Junior Historians 
and was a member of the Nation-
al Honor Society. MiKayla was 
awarded the Ruth Winegarten 
Women in Texas History Award. 
She plans to attend Amarillo Col-
lege to major in Pre-med.

Christopher Ryan 
Shults 

Christopher Shults, son of 
Jennifer Shults and grandson of 
Carolyn Shults, played football 
for four years, advancing to Bi-
district his freshman year, ad-
vancing to Area his sophomore 
year, District champs junior ad-
vancing to Area, and going to Bi-
district his sir year.

He was also involved in 4-H 
horse judging and horse quiz 
bowl for four years, He went to 
state his freshman year in both 
events, He went to state all four 
years for horse quiz bowl plac-
ing fi rst at every district contest 

Chandace Hanna Leigh 
Ritchie 

Congratulations from

Mike’s Pharmacy 
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Mikayla LaVelle Shadle

Congratulations from

Clarendon Insurance Agency

Ashley Nicole Smith

Congratulations from

Lila’s Hair Salon 

Christopher Ryan Shults

Congratulations from

Guys & Dolls Salon

Tyler Lee Smith

Congratulations from

Morrow Drilling & Service

he and his team participated in. 
Christopher participated in 

FFA and was on the Clarendon 
FFA radio team for four years.

Ashley Nicole Smith
Ashley Smith, daughter of 

Melissa Armstrong and Dar-
rell Smith, was a member of the 
CHS annual staff for 3 years, 
class representative for student 
council for 2 years, and member 
of FCCLA for 1 year. Her fresh-
man year, Ashley participated 
in “Shorts in November” win-
ning the Best Dramatic Screen 
Write award. She was also a UIL 
competitor in Current Events her 
freshman year advancing to Re-
gionals. 

Ashley volunteered and orga-
nized fundraisers at the Donley 
County Senior Citizens Center. 
She will attend Clarendon Col-
lege in the fall.

Tyler Lee Smith
Tyler Smith, son of Rodney 

Smith and Angelia Williams, 
played football for four years, 
advancing to 2nd round playoffs 
his junior year and 1st round his 
senior year, and ran track for four 
years, advancing to Regionals 
his freshman year.

McKaelie Ashton 
Thomas

McKaelie Thomas, daugh-
ter of Becky Rattan and Darrell 
Thomas, participated in annual 
staff for two years. She worked 
part time all four years of high 
school. Mckaelie plans on at-
tending Amarillo College to be-
come an X-ray Technician.

Jaimie Silver Vinson
Jaimie Silver Vinson, daugh-

ter of Garey and Georgianna 
Vinson, was a member of the 
band her freshman year, played 
softball as a sophomore and ju-
nior and was in drama her junior 
year. She also participated in the 
4H stock show and participated 
in a volunteer walk for Multiple 
Sclerosis her senior year. Jaimie 
plans on attending Clarendon 
College to become an LVN and 
later an neonatal nurse.

Kristen Denise 
Watson

Kristen Watson, daughter of 
Carl and Karen Watson, was a 
member in the 4H, took part in 
the band her freshman year, par-
ticipated in drama for one year, 
and was a member of the year-
book annual staff her sophomore 

McKaelie Ashton Thomas

Congratulations from

Floyd’s Automotive Supply
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Jaimie Silver Vinson 
Congratulations from

Lowe’s Family Center

Kristen Denise Watson 

Congratulations from

Sandell Drive-In

Tylee Jo Williams

Congratulations from

Cornell’s Country Store

Wesley Don Williams

Congratulations from

Lakeside Marina

and junior year. She plans to at-
tend college at the Art Institute 
in Fort Worth through the online 
program for photography.

Tylee Jo Williams
Tylee Williams, daughter of 

Ty and Nikolyn Williams, at-
tended Wellington High School 
and transferred to CHS her se-
nior year. She showed angus cat-
tle, winning fi rst in showmanship 
her sophomore and senior year 
at the Fort Worth Stock Show 
and Grand Champion Cow Calf 
Pair at the National Junior Angus 
show.

She judged livestock in FFA. 
Her team won fi rst at area and 
was second at state her senior 
year.

She judged Livestock in 4-H 
advancing to state four years and 
advancing to state three years in 
Beef Quiz Bowl.

She was fi rst in sales talk at 
the National Junior Angus Show.

She was the Texas Angus 
Queen, Texas Junior Angus Pres-
ident, and voting delegate for the 
National Junior Angus Associa-
tion.

Tylee plans to attend Texas 
Tech University to major in Ag-
riculture Communications.

Wesley Don Williams
Wesley Williams, son of Wes-

ley and Ronda Williams and Sha-
nita Harris, played football for 
four years, ran track four years, 
and played basketball for four 
years. He was named 2-1A All-
District Offensive MVP in foot-
ball. He was also recognized in 
basketball for playing good de-
fense. He has advanced in track 
starting with placing 2nd in long 
jump at the district meet, 2nd at 
the area meet, and 1st at the re-
gionals meet, and and received 
a bronze medal at the state track 
meet in Austin, Texas.

Samuel Lee Crawford 
Wolfe

Samuel Wolfe, son of George 
Hall and Bernadette Wolfe, 
played rugby for three years, 
won the island tournament his 
sophomore year, and played 
football for two at Bahrain High 
School.  He transferred to CHS 
his senior year and competed 
in UIL current issues his senior 
year.  Samuel also volunteered 
for the V.F.W. since age four.  He 
plans to attend Clarendon Col-
lege in the fall.

Samuel Lee 
Crawford Wolfe

Congratulations from

Joe’s Lawn and Tree Care
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Our gift to you...
FREE

Call us today 
at 874-2259.
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The best of luck to all our ambitious young graduates.  You’re the hope and the future of our 
community, and we look forward to great things from each and every one of you.

Congratulations on a job well done!

Member FDIC • An Equal Housing Lender

HERRING BANKHERRING BANK
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Joseph Patrick Allen

Congratulations from

Hedley Lioness Club

Conner Leon Bevers

Congratulations from

Hedley Feedlot

Christopher Dalton 
Blackburn

Congratulations from

Clarendon Insurance Agency

Kassidy Lynn Burton

Congratulations from

J&W Lumber

Joseph Patrick Allen
Joseph Allen, son of Russell 

Allen and Tiffany Wilkinson, 
played tennis for four years, ran 
track for two years, and played 
basketball for two years. He 
was also involved in One Act 
Play for four years, was a UIL 
Compeditor in number sense 
for one year and science for 
four years, and was a member 
of NHS. He held the offi ce of 
class reporter during his Junior 
year. He was awarded All Star 
Cast for 2012 while in OAP and 
was awarded the Math Honor 
award during his freshmen and 
junior year. Joseph plans on at-
tending Clarendon College for 
two years, and later on attend-
ing Texas Tech University the 
remainder of his years where he 
will major in Mathematics.

Conner Leon Bevers
Conner Leon Bevers, Son of 

Kendra Bevers and Ross Kend-
all. Conner’s plans for college 
are to go to Francis Tuttle in 
Oklahoma City and pursue a ca-
reer in pipe line welding.

Christopher Dalton 
Blackburn

Chris Blackburn, son of 
Butch and Paula Blackburn 
participated in FFA, 4H and 
many athletic activities. He 
was awarded the State Farmer 
award in FFA his junior year, 
awarded senior cattle showman-
ship his freshman year, and has 
earned many athletic awards. 
His awards in football include: 
10th Grade-All District Defen-
sive End, and All District 2nd 
Team Utility Back; 11th Grade-

All District 1st Team Full Back 
,All District 1st Team Defen-
sive End,All Region 1st Team 
Defensive End- DII -Region 
I,All State Honorable Mention 
Defensive End,Hedley ISD 
Fighting Heart Football Award. 
In 12th Grade Chris received- 
All District Defensive End, All 
District Full Back, All Region 
Full Back, Six Man Football 
All-Star,Golden Spread Team- 
Defensive End. He has partici-
pated in Football for 4 years, 
Basketball for 2 years, Track for 
2 years, Tennis 1 year.

Chris is the senior class Sec-
retary. He was also a member 
of the FFA radio team his fresh-
man year. Chris will either at-
tend Amarillo College or Frank 
Phillips and obtain a welding 
certifi cate.

Kassidy Lynn Burton
Kassidy Burton, daughter 

of Blain and Tanya Burton, ran 
cross country for four years, and 
played basketball for four years 
recieving all district her junior 
year and senior year.She got 
all star cast in one act play her 
sophmore, junior, and senior 
year. She was also involved in 
cheerleading, track, and NHS. 
She was 2012 Homecoming 
Queen and was awarded Hedley 
Lions Club Sweetheart. Kassidy 
plans to attend Amarillo Col-
lege to become a paramedic.

Laura Ketzer
Laura Ketzer is an exchange 

student from Berlin, Germany. 
She is the daughter of Rene & 
Stefanie Ketzer and her host 
parents in America are John 
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Laura Ketzer

Congratulations from

Wes & Lana Ritchie

William Guy Lewis

Congratulations from

Donley County Gin

Joshua McKenzie 
Llewellyn

Congratulations from

Country Bloomers 
Flowers & Gifts

Ethan Earl Naylor

Congratulations from

Monroe’s Peach Ranch

and Diane Conatser. In Germa-
ny, Laura played Volleyball for 
three years. In America she par-
ticipated in many school activi-
ties, such as Basketball, Tennis, 
Track, UIL and One Act Play. 
Laura got Academic All-District 
in Basketball and best technical 
crew for lightening in One Act 
Play. She is also Vice President 
in her Senior Class and Lions 
Club Runner-up. Laura volun-
teered in projects like Evelyn 
Rivers and the Senior Citizen 
Banquet. She plans to attend a 
college in Germany and become 
a translator.

William Guy Lewis
William Guy Lewis, son 

of Linda Lewis and the Late 
Billy Lewis, lives right across 
the street from the school. He 
doesn’t care for sports too 
much, but he is a great student. 
He never gives anyone any trou-
ble. He just minds his own busi-
ness and gets along great with 
everyone. He has had a number 
of jobs, but right now he is just 
doing odd jobs for anyone who 
needs work done, he has a very 
strong work ethic. He has lived 
in Hedley his whole life and 
plans on sticking around.

Joshua McKenzie 
Llewellyn

Josh Llewellyn, son of She-
lia Llewellyn, has played bas-
ketball for three years. Even 
though he hasn’t played many 
sports, he is very helpful around 
the school, and will help anyone 
in need. He enjoys playing bas-
ketball and helping his brother 
when in need. Josh plans to at-

tend SPC in the fall on 2012.

Ethan Earl Naylor
Ethan Naylor, son of Linda 

Naylor and the late Tex Naylor, 
played basketball, participated 
in track throwing the shot put 
and discus his senior year, was 
an active member of FFA for 
four years, and was also in UIL 
for three years, participating in 
current events. Ethan plans to 
go to college and pursue a ca-
reer in technology. He would 
then like to seek employment at 
Halliburton.

Dehvan Renee Neeley
Dehvan Renee Neeley, 

Granddaughter of Ricki Baker, 
played, volleyball, basketball, 
softball, tennis, track, and was 
a cheerleader her freshman 
through junior years. She was 
All-Star Softball Player 2009 
and 2010. She was a class of-
fi cer and student council repre-
sentative 3 for years. She was 
also inducted into National 
Honor Society Her freshman, 
sophomore, and junior years. 
Dehvan volunteered in nursing 
homes, town cleanup, senior 
citizens luncheons, Veterans 
Day luncheons, and holiday 
canned food and toy drives. De-
hvan has accumulated 21 hours 
of college credits and will fi nish 
her degree at Clarendon College 
for Criminal Justice. Afterwards 
she will attend Amarillo Police 
Academy to become a police 
offi cer.

Cassie Lynn Pickle
Cassie Pickle, daughter of 

Doug and Krista Pickle, partici-
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Dehvan Renee Neeley

Congratulations from

Kari’s Photography

Cassie Lynn Pickle

Congratulations from

Richard Shepperd, DDS

Jacob Daniel Ramirez

Congratulations from

Cattlemen’s 2 Feedlot

Kadee Beth Riggs

Congratulations from

Cattlemen’s 2 Feedlot

pated in her school band, var-
sity cross country, varsity track, 
and tennis. She was a member 
of book club, foreign language 
club, and National Honor So-
ciety, holding an offi ce in each 
club. She plays piano and is go-
ing to State competition for her 
third time this May. She also 
competed in UIL in accounting 
and mathematics, advancing to 
regionals in both. She has vol-
unteered at Skaggs hospital, at 
the local library, with elemen-
tary students, and was part of 
the Snacks in Packs program. 
Cassie will attend Tyler Junior 
College and complete the Ra-
diologic Technology program

Jacob Daniel Ramirez
Jacob Ramirez is the son of 

Consuelo Ramirez. He has par-
ticipated as football manager, 
helping with the elementary stu-
dents during recesses, and has 
done community service while 

outside of school. Jacob also 
helps out with special school 
occasions. 

He plans to work out at The 
Cattleman Feedlot with his 
grandfather instead of attending 
college.

Kadee Beth Riggs
Kadee Riggs, daughter of 

Timothy and Lori Riggs, played 
tennis for four years, UIL com-
petitor for two years, ran track 
for two years, advancing to re-
gional my senior year in tennis. 
Kadee was class treasurer her 
sophomore year. Kadee plans 
to attend Clarendon College to 
major in nursing.

Sierra Malise Shelp
Sierra Shelp, daughter of 

Daron Shelp and Christina Hen-
son, competed in various activi-
ties such as: cross country, bas-
ketball, cheerleading, track, and 
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Thank You
This Graduation Edition would not have been possible 

without the assistance of our advertisers, Diane Skelton, Larry 
Jeffers, Valerie Ashcraft, Suzanne Taylor, Kari Lindsey, and, of 
course, the graduates themselves. Senior portraits and panels 
are all photos by Blunk’s. Cap and gown pictures are by the 
CHS Yearbook Staff and Kari Lindsey.  

Congratulations to all our graduating seniors! Best wishes 
to all of you.

Sierra Malise Shelp

Congratulations from

Sims Roofi ng

Patricia Dawn Valles

Congratulations from

Greenbelt Water Authority 

Rance Akers 
Maxwell Watt

Congratulations from

Lakeside Marina

tennis. She advanced to region-
als in cross country three years, 
named All-District fi rst team 
her junior year in basketball, 
advanced to area three years in 
track, and regionals her fresh-
man year. She also competed 
in science UIL and advanced 
to regionals her sophomore and 
senior year. She held offi ce as 
class president all four years, 
was cheerleading captain, bas-
ketball captain, and vice presi-
dent of NHS her senior year. 
She plans to attend Clarendon 
College, and later pursue a ca-
reer in the medical fi eld.

Patricia 
Dawn Valles

Patricia Valles, daughter of 
Patricia Saunders, played bas-
ketball for two years, threw shot 
put and discus for the past four 
years, participated in UIL Cur-
rent Events and Social Studies 

the past four years went to Re-
gional’s her senior year in So-
cial Studies.

She held class offi cer for the 
past four years Vice President 
her freshman and Junior year , 
Secretary her sophomore year, 
and Treasurer her senior year, 
She held several honors in Art 
class for the past three years 
and in History class the past two 
years. Patricia plans to attend 
Clarendon College to major in 
nursing.

Rance Akers 
Maxwell Watt

Rance Watt, son of Karen 
and Keith Watt, did One Act 
Play for three years, and re-
ceived Honorable Mention All 
Star Cast at District his senior 
year. He is undecided about go-
ing to college. He would like to 
be a game designer one day.

STAVENHAGEN VIDEO

smile,
Grads!

Each Clarendon & Hedley 
graduate receives a FREE Photo 
DVD of CHS & HHS graduation

and a FREE 5x7 print courtesy of

and

DVDs will be ready for pick up 
at the Enterprise on June 1, 2012.

Limit one per graduate.
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Member FDIC
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Commencement day is fi nally here, and we would like to wish you the best of luck every 
step of the way on your path to success.  Keep setting your sights high, giving it nothing 
less than your best effort, and you will be sure to ultimately reach your goals.

Congratulations to all the Donley County Seniors on a job well-done!

Insurance Agency



<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /All
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Warning
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness false
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages false
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 150
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages false
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 150
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages false
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 400
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000500044004600206587686353ef901a8fc7684c976262535370673a548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200208fdb884c9ad88d2891cf62535370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef653ef5728684c9762537088686a5f548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200204e0a73725f979ad854c18cea7684521753706548679c300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents for quality printing on desktop printers and proofers.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA <>
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020b370c2a4d06cd0d10020d504b9b0d1300020bc0f0020ad50c815ae30c5d0c11c0020ace0d488c9c8b85c0020c778c1c4d560002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken voor kwaliteitsafdrukken op desktopprinters en proofers. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /BleedOffset [
        0
        0
        0
        0
      ]
      /ConvertColors /NoConversion
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /NA
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure true
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles true
      /MarksOffset 6
      /MarksWeight 0.250000
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /NA
      /PageMarksFile /RomanDefault
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
    <<
      /AllowImageBreaks true
      /AllowTableBreaks true
      /ExpandPage false
      /HonorBaseURL true
      /HonorRolloverEffect false
      /IgnoreHTMLPageBreaks false
      /IncludeHeaderFooter false
      /MarginOffset [
        0
        0
        0
        0
      ]
      /MetadataAuthor ()
      /MetadataKeywords ()
      /MetadataSubject ()
      /MetadataTitle ()
      /MetricPageSize [
        0
        0
      ]
      /MetricUnit /inch
      /MobileCompatible 0
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (GoLive)
        (8.0)
      ]
      /OpenZoomToHTMLFontSize false
      /PageOrientation /Portrait
      /RemoveBackground false
      /ShrinkContent true
      /TreatColorsAs /MainMonitorColors
      /UseEmbeddedProfiles false
      /UseHTMLTitleAsMetadata true
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


